

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Safety Vest  
 FOR:  
 TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2019)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 28, 2018

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78233	Abel Unlimited, Inc. 2020 Seabird Way Riviera Beach, FL 33404	Reflective Apparel Factory, Inc. 1649 Sands Place SE, Ste. J Marietta, GA 30067	Sunwest Sales Co. 1619 Whipple Road Haward, CA 94544	Crawford Electric Supply 343 N. Weidner Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	Promo Solutions 11104 Windjammer Drive Frisco, TX 75036	Stroud Safety Apparel 11410 Pagemill Rd. Dallas, TX 75243	Saf-T-Glove	Impact Products	R&R Industries, Inc. 204 Avenida Fabricante San Clemente, CA 92672	Alamo Distribution, LLC dba Alamo Iron Works
1.	450 ea. Safety Vest in Size Medium, SAWS #17390 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 2,079.00 MCR	5.45 2,452.50 Ironwear #7062	5.84 2,628.00 RAF-LM	4.70 2,115.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 3,784.50	12.50 5,625.00	17.00 7,650.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.	650 ea. Safety Vest in Size Large, SAWS #17389 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 3,003.00 MCR	5.45 3,542.50 Ironwear #7062	5.84 3,796.00 RAF-LM	4.70 3,055.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 5,466.50	12.50 8,125.00	17.00 11,050.00				
3.	1,000 ea. Safety Vest in Size, Extra Large, SAWS #17391 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 4,620.00 MCR	5.45 5,450.00 Ironwear #7062	5.84 5,840.00 RAF-LM	5.65 5,650.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 8,410.00	12.50 12,500.00	17.00 17,000.00				
4.	750 ea. Safety Vest in Size 2X Large, SAWS #17385 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 3,465.00 MCR	5.45 4,087.50 Ironwear #7062	5.84 4,380.00 RAF-LM	5.65 4,237.50 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 6,307.50	12.50 9,375.00	17.50 13,125.00				
5.	600 ea. Safety Vest in Size 3X Large, SAWS #17386 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 2,772.00 MCR	5.45 3,270.00 Ironwear #7062	5.84 3,504.00 RAF-LM	6.18 3,708.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 5,046.00	12.50 7,500.00	18.00 10,800.00				
6.	350 ea. Safety Vest in Size 4X Large, SAWS #17387 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 1,617.00 MCR	5.45 1,907.50 Ironwear #7062	5.84 2,044.00 RAF-LM	8.50 2,975.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 2,943.50	12.50 4,375.00	19.00 6,650.00				
7.	300 ea. Safety Vest in Size 5X large, SAWS #17388 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 1,386.00 MCR	5.45 1,635.00 Ironwear #7062	5.84 1,752.00 RAF-LM	8.50 2,550.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 2,523.00	12.50 3,750.00	20.00 6,000.00				
8.	100 ea. Safety Vest in Size Small, SAWS #47920 Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 462.00 MCR	5.45 545.00 Ironwear #7062	5.84 584.00 RAF-LM	8.50 850.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 841.00	12.50 1,250.00	17.00 1,700.00				
9.	50 ea. Safety Vest Visitor in Size Larger, Lawson No. Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 231.00 MCR	5.45 272.50 Ironwear #7062	5.84 292.00 RAF-LM	8.50 425.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.41 420.50	12.50 625.00	17.00 850.00				
10.	50 ea. Safety Vest Visitor in Size X-Larger, Lawson No. Make/Model No.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.62 231.00 MCR	5.45 272.50 Ironwear #7062	5.84 292.00 RAF-LM	8.50 425.00 Brite Safety Style 1232-FY	8.40 420.00	12.50 625.00	17.00 850.00				
	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>	TOTAL	<b>19,866.00</b>	23,435.00	25,112.00	25,990.50	36,162.50	53,750.00	75,675.00				
	Terms		2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	
	Delivery Days		90-120 days	3 days	12 days	7 days	14 days			15 days	22 days	35 days	

**\*LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Abel Unlimited, Inc.  
 Absolute Equipment  
 Airgas  
 AIW  
 Apex Pinnacle  
 Associated Bag  
 Bullchase  
 Carolina Glove Co.  
 Conney Safety  
 Crawford Electric Supply  
 Esafety Supplies

Glob Electric  
 GTL Solutions  
 Hagemeyer  
 Honeywell Safety  
 Impact Products  
 Impact Products  
 Just In Trend  
 Kee Safety  
 Koncept Safety  
 Lawmens  
 Leons Caps

Mastermans  
 Meister Supply  
 MOSSA, LLC  
 New Pig  
 Promo Solutions  
 R&R Industries, Inc.  
 Reflective Apparel Factory  
 Royall Matthiessen  
 SA Lighthouse  
 Safety Supply  
 Safety Unlimited

Saftgard  
 Saf-T-Glove  
 SC Fastening  
 Stroud Safety Apparel  
 Sunbelt Mill Supply  
 Sunwest Sales Co.  
 Wenzel Associates  
  
 Demandstar  
 SAWS Website